
 

[Date] 

 

[Editor’s name] 

[Editor’s designation] 

[Insert Journal name] 

 

Dear Dr/Mr/Ms: 

 

My coauthors and I would like to submit the attached manuscript entitled “Acute Mercury 

Poisoning: A Case Report” for publication in [Insert journal name in italics] as a case report. 

 

Lack of public awareness of the serious health risks of mercury intoxication can lead to 

negligence and life-threatening disease conditions. We present a case that highlights how critical 

public education in this regard is. A 36-year-old woman presented with acute symptoms of 

mercury poisoning a few days after the sudden death of her 14-month-old healthy infant. She 

reported that her other child had brought home metallic mercury and placed it on a heating stove 

one day before her infant died. We administered empirical treatment with NAC because no 

clinical confirmation could be performed, and the patient was free of any symptoms at the follow-

up. This unfortunate case could have been avoided had the teacher and the mother of the child 

both been more careful and aware of such hazards. 

 

[Insert information explaining the motivation for submission to this journal in not more than 2–3 

sentences] We believe that the findings of this study are relevant to the scope of your journal and 

will be of interest to its readership.  

 

Please consider, as potential referees, ______. 

 

This manuscript has not been published or presented elsewhere in part or in entirety, and is not 

under consideration by another journal. Informed consent for publication of this report was 

obtained from the patient whose case has been described. All the authors have approved the 

manuscript and agree with submission to your esteemed journal. There are no conflicts of interest 

to declare. 

 

Thank you for your consideration. I look forward to hearing from you. 

 

Sincerely, 

[Author’s name] 

[Affiliation] 

[Postal address] 

[Phone number] 

[Fax number] 

[Email address] 

Comment [A1]:  Please enter the date of 
submission here. 

Comment [A2]:  Please enter the name and 
designation (e.g., Editor, Editor-in-Chief) of the 
journal editor. 

Comment [A3]: Use the editor’s name above, 
along with the appropriate salutation. If the 
editor’s name is not known, replace with “To 
the Editors.” 

Comment [A4]: Please replace with 
“enclosed” if you are submitting the letter by 
post. 

Comment [A5]: While I have attempted to 

prepare an interesting summary of your case, as 
mentioned in the edited file, the motivation and 

significance are still unclear. Please revise this 

paragraph after you have addressed all my comments 

in the edited file. 

Comment [A6]: If you have some referees in 
mind, name them here, along with their postal 
addresses, phone and fax numbers, and email 
addresses. Otherwise, please delete this 
sentence. 

Comment [A7]: Please ensure that this has been 
done. 

Comment [A8]:  If you choose to declare 
competing interests separately, replace this 
sentence with the following one: “Details about 
competing interests are provided separately.” 

Comment [A9]:  If you are submitting this 
letter in the hard copy, please insert about 4 line 
spaces below “Sincerely” for your signature. 

Comment [A10]:  Enter the name, affiliation, 
and contact details of the corresponding author. 




